
Mowing Services for City of Deer Park - Bid Tabulation

2016
Discount Total Total Total

Each Annual = 44 Each Annual = 44 Each Annual = 22 Each Annual = 1 Annual (A+B+C+Alt 1- Discount) Annual (A+B) Annual (A + B + C)

Griswold Mowing and Landscaping No 1,485.00$    65,340.00$       735.00$        32,340.00$       3,270.00$      71,940.00$      16.5/ 40lbs. Bag 16.5/ 40lbs. Bag -$                 169,620.00$                                      97,680.00$       169,620.00$           

Groundstar No 705.00$       31,020.00$       610.00$        26,840.00$       1,800.00$      39,600.00$      2,500.00$              2,500.00$              4,998.00$       94,962.00$                                        57,860.00$       97,460.00$             

Landscapes Unlimited No 868.70$       38,222.80$       908.03$        39,953.32$       1,940.64$      42,694.08$      NO BID NO BID 2,417.40$       118,452.80$                                      78,176.12$       120,870.20$           

Longclaw Contractors No/Yes 530.00$       23,320.00$       530.00$        23,320.00$       1,024.80$      22,545.60$      500.00$                 500.00$                 3,484.28$       66,201.32$                                        46,640.00$       69,185.60$             

NCC Services No 4,200.00$    184,800.00$     4,700.00$     206,800.00$     7,800.00$      171,600.00$    NO BID NO BID -$                 563,200.00$                                      391,600.00$     563,200.00$           

Professional Lawn Care Services Yes 1,258.00$    55,352.00$       1,046.00$     46,024.00$       2,800.00$      61,600.00$      800.00$                 800.00$                 -$                 163,776.00$                                      101,376.00$     162,976.00$           

Summer Breeze Lawns Yes 60,000.00$  2,640,000.00$  60,000.00$  2,640,000.00$  30,000.00$   660,000.00$    $99/yard $99/yard -$                 5,940,000.00$                                   5,280,000.00$  5,940,000.00$        

Von Younger Landscaping No 2,150.00$    94,600.00$       1,750.00$     77,000.00$       2,900.00$      63,800.00$      7,800.00$              7,800.00$              4,864.00$       238,336.00$                                      171,600.00$     235,400.00$           

Low Bid

Addendum #1Name
Area A Area B Area C Alternate 1


