BID — REFUSE BAGS
Bid Date 06.12.17

Name
Contractor/Bidder

18,000 Rolls

20,000 Rolls

22,000 Rolls

24,000 Rolls

Dispose N Save
5 Getzil Berger Blvd. #102
Monroe, NY 10950

Unit Price: $10.18
Total Bid: $183,240.

Unit Price: $10.14
Total Bid: $202,800.

Unit Price: $10.12
Total Bid: $222,640.

Unit Price: $10.10
Total Bid: $242,400.

Interboro Packaging Corporation

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY 12549

Unit Price: $8.34
Total Bid: $150,120.

Unit Price: $8.32
Total Bid: $166,400.

Unit Price: $8.24
Total Bid: $181,280.

Unit Price: $8.22
Total Bid: $197,280.

Houston Poly Bag
11726 Holderrieth Road
Tomball, TX 77375\

Unit Price: $8.79
Total Bid: $158,220.

Unit Price: $8.79
Total Bid: $175,800.

Unit Price: $8.79
Total Bid: $193,380.

Unit Price: $8.67
Total Bid: $208,080.

Central Poly Corp.
2400 Bedle PI
Linden, NJ 07036

Unit Price: $8.90
Total Bid: $160,200.

Unit Price: $8.80
Total Bid: $176,000.

Unit Price: $8.77
Total Bid: $192,940.

Unit Price: $8.77
Total Bid: $210,480.

Waste Zero, Incorporated
8540 Colonnade Center Drive
Raleigh, NC 27615

Unit Price: $10.40
Total Bid: $187,200.

Unit Price: $10.36
Total Bid: $207,200.

Unit Price: $10.32
Total Bid: $227,040.

Unit Price: $10.28
Total Bid: $246,720.

Dyna Pak Corp.
112 Helton Drive
Lawrenceburg, TN 38464

NO BID
Unit Price: $
Total Bid: $

NO BID
Unit Price: $
Total Bid: $

NO BID
Unit Price: $
Total Bid: $

NO BID
Unit Price: $
Total Bid: $

Aleph Industry
106 Lexington Avenue
Brooklyn, NY 11238

Unit Price: $8.40
Total Bid: $151,200.

Unit Price: $8.40
Total Bid: $168,000.

Unit Price: $8.40
Total Bid: $184,800.

Unit Price: $8.40
Total Bid: $201,600.

*HAYDEN TWIST DRILL & TOOL BID NOT ACCEPTED. SHIPPED TO WRONG ADDRESS AND NOT RECEIVED BY 2 P.M.




