Vendor

HOUSTON POLY BAG

11726 HOLDERRIETH RD.

TOMBALL, TX. 77375
* Addendum - yes

Bid Opening

Refuse Bags

July 16, 2018

2p.m.

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price:___$8.74
Unit Price: $8.67

Unit Price:__$8.61
Unit Price: $8.57

Unit Price:__ $13.20
UnitPrice:ﬂ
UnitPrice:ﬂ
Unit Price:__ $12.99
Unit Price:___$17.48
Unit Price:___$17.34
Unit Price:__ $17.22
Unit Price:__ $17.14

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

$139.840

$156,060.

$172,200.

$188,540.

$211.200.

$235,800

$261,200.

$285.780.

$279,680.

$312,120.

$344,400

$377,080.




Vendor

WASTEZERO

8540 COLONNADE CENTER DR.

SUITE 210
RALEIGH, NC 27615

*Addendum - NO SAMPLES

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls  Unit Price:__$11.87 Total : $189,920.

Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls  Unit Price:___$11.87  Total: $213,660.

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls  Unit Price:___$11.87 _ Total: $237,400.
Option D - Quantity: 22,000 rolls  Unit Price:____11.87 _ Total: $261,140.

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls  Unit Price:_$18.14  Total:  $290,240.

Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls  Unit Price:__$18.14 Total:  $326,520.

Option C—Quantity: 20,000 rolls ~ Unit Price: $18.14  Total: $362,800.
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls Unit Price: _$18.14 _ Total:  $399,080.

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls  Unit Price__$24.41 _ Total: _ $390,560.

Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls ~ Unit Price:_ $24.41  Total: _ $439,380.
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls ~ Unit Price:__ $24.41 _Total: _ $488,200.

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls  Unit Price:____$24.41 Total: _  $537,020.



Vendor

CENTRAL POLY CORP.
2400 BEDLE PLACE
LINDEN, NJ 07036
*Addendum - Yes
Request for Bid Tab

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price:_$9.11

Unit Price: $9.11

Unit Price: $9.11

Unit Price:_$9.11

Unit Price:

Unit Price:__$13.66

Unit Price:__$13.66
$13.66

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price

$13.66

$18.21
$18.21

$18.21

- $18.21

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:

$145.760.

$163,980.

$182,200.

$200,420

$218,560

$245,880.

$273,200.

$300,520.

$291,360.

$327,780.

$364,200.

$400,620.




Vendor

DISPOSE N SAVE
5 GETZIL BERGER BLVD #102
MONTGOMERY, NY 10950

*Addendum - Yes

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

$11.14

$11.10

$11.04

$10.98

$16.18

$16.14
$16.08
$16.04

$21.18
$21.08

$21.04

$20.98

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

$178,240.

$199.800.

$200,800.

$241,560.

$258.880.

$290,520.

$321,600.

$352 ]R0

$338.880.

$379.440.

$420,800.

$461.560.




Vendor

COMPLETE SUPPLY INC.
1624 W. CROSBY ST. #144
CARROLLTON, TX. 75006

*Addendum - Not Acknowledged

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price:__ NO BID

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:;_ NO BID

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:_$25.51
Unit Price;_$25.51

Unit Price:__$25.51
Unit Price;_ $25.51

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

NO BID

NO BID

$408.181.80

$459,204.50

$510,227.30

$561,250.00




Vendor

UNIPAK CORP.
P.O. BOX 300027
BROOKLYN, NY 11230

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls
Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls

Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price: NO BID

Unit Price:
Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:_ NO BID
Unit Price:
Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:__ NQ BID

Unit Price:
Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




Vendor

INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP.

114 BRACKEN RD
MONTGOMERY, NY 12549

*RECEIVED LATE

2 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

3 MiL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

4 MIL

Option A — Quantity: 16,000 rolls
Option B — Quantity: 18,000 rolls

Option C — Quantity: 20,000 rolls
Option D — Quantity: 22,000 rolls

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:

Unit Price:
Unit Price:

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:

Total:

Total:

Total:
Total:
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